
BID DATE: APRIL 9, 2015
SUBJECT: GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
FOR: LEHIGH VALLEY COOPERATIVE PURCHASING COUNCIL
OWNER: COUNTY OF LEHIGH

Gainsville, GA Aston, PA Fort Wayne, IN

BID SECURITY BB $10,000.00 BB $10,000.00 BB $10,000.00

GASOLINE TANKWAGON DELIVERIES:

PREMIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D)

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A thru E)

Brand Name Offered

Octane Rating

MEDIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D)

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A thru E)

Brand Name Offered

Octane Rating

REGULAR GRADE: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D)

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A thru E)

Brand Name Offered

Octane Rating

Petroleum Traders 
Corp.

DRAFT TABULATION SHEET
(#15-012)

Mansfield Oil Co. of 
Gainsville, Inc. PAPCO, Inc.

1 LVCPC - Gas(DraftTab)15, 4/9/2015



Mansfield PAPCO, Inc. Petroluem Traders

GASOLINE TRANSPORT DELIVERIES:

PREMIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium ($0.12400) ($0.00090)

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.09400) No Bid ($0.00090)
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00171 $0.00171

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.01100 $0.01100

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.08960 $2.08960

Net delivered price (A thru E) $2.0093 $2.1024

Brand Name Offered Various Various

Octane Rating 93 93

MEDIUM GRADE: Less discount or plus premium ($0.08580) ($0.03000) ($0.00090)

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.05580) ($0.03000) ($0.00090)
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00171 $0.00171 $0.00171

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.01100 $0.01100 $0.01100

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015 $1.86300 $1.86300 $1.86300

Net delivered price (A thru E) $1.8209 $1.84671 $1.8758

Brand Name Offered Various Unbranded Various

Octane Rating 89 89 89

REGULAR GRADE: Less discount or plus premium ($0.07370) ($0.02410) $0.00270

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.04370) ($0.02410) $0.00270
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00171 $0.00171 $0.00171

PA USTIF/LUST tax (D) $0.01100 $0.01100 $0.01100

F.O.B. Terminal (E) a/o 03/09/2015 $1.74480 $1.74480 $1.74480

Net delivered price (A thru E) $1.7148 $1.73441 $1.7612

Brand Name Offered Various Unbranded Various

Octane Rating 87 87 87

DIESEL TANKWAGON DELIVERIES:

Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D)

Brand Name Offered

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend

Add-on for winterized blend

ULTRA LOW 
SULFUR, OFF 
ROAD:
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Mansfield PAPCO, Inc. Petroluem Traders

B2, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D)

Brand Name Offered

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend

Add-on for winterized blend

B5, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D)

Brand Name Offered

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend

Add-on for winterized blend

B2, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D)

Brand Name Offered

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend

Add-on for winterized blend

B5, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium 

Local delivery costs (if any)

Total Fixed Cost (A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Federal LUST tax (B)

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) 

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D)

Brand Name Offered

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend

Add-on for winterized blend
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Mansfield PAPCO, Inc. Petroluem Traders

DIESEL TRANSPORT DELIVERIES:

Less discount or plus premium ($0.04600) $0.01220

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.01600) No Bid $0.01220
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00190 $0.00190

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.27880 $2.27880

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $2.26570 $2.29390

Brand Name Offered Various Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.15000 $0.20000

Add-on for winterized blend $0.02500 $0.02500

B2, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium ($0.04590) $0.01500

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.01590) No Bid $0.01500
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00186 $0.00186

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.26740 $2.26740

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $2.2544 $2.2853

Brand Name Offered Various Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.15000 $0.20000

Add-on for winterized blend $0.02500 $0.02500

B5, OFF ROAD: Less discount or plus premium ($0.04330) $0.01470

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.01330) No Bid $0.01470
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00181 $0.00181

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.26700 $2.26700

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $2.2565 $2.2845

Brand Name Offered Various Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.15000 $0.20000

Add-on for winterized blend $0.02500 $0.02500

B2, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium ($0.05540) ($0.00730) ($0.00050)

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.02540) ($0.00730) ($0.00050)
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00186 $0.00186 $0.00186

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.26290 $2.26290 $2.26290

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $2.2404 $2.25846 $2.2653

Brand Name Offered Various Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.15000 $0.09000 $0.20000

Add-on for winterized blend $0.02500 $0.03500 $0.02500

ULTRA LOW 
SULFUR, OFF 
ROAD:
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Mansfield PAPCO, Inc. Petroluem Traders

B5, ON ROAD: Less discount or plus premium ($0.04570) ($0.00920) $0.01920

Local delivery costs (if any) $0.03000 $0.00000 $0.00000

Total Fixed Cost (A) ($0.01570) ($0.00920) $0.01920
Federal LUST tax (B) $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100

Federal Oil Spill tax (C) $0.00181 $0.00181 $0.00181

F.O.B. Terminal (D) a/o 03/09/2015 $2.23310 $2.23310 $2.23310

Net delivered price (A+B+C+D) $2.2202 $2.22671 $2.2551

Brand Name Offered Various Unbranded Various

Add-on for 30% kerosene blend $0.15000 $0.09000 $0.20000

Add-on for winterized blend $0.02500 $0.03500 $0.02500

No No No

No No No

Yes / Yes / Yes
(Upon Mutual 
Agreement)

Yes (thru 5/1/15) / 
No / No

Yes / Yes / Yes

Yes Yes Yes

No Bid replies were received from:

*  TAC Energy - Dallas, TX

CITY OF ALLENTOWN RESIDENT PREFERENCE 
FORM (Qualifies?)

COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM FORM 
(Extend to Others?)

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (Completed?)

Early Pay Discount?
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